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DOLIDEN T,I MITE D 

GIBRALTAR hlINE TO CLOSE - Anders Bulow, president, Bolidcn 

L.imited has been ur:sbie 10 obiain t!.c fundi;;g cr~nn*Li:n~~:~ 
necessary to complete its qreemen! to e;Guirz Bolidcn's Gihrz!rar 
copper minc near Willim?< Lake. RC. A.s B rerult, tt:c acquisrcion 

'zpreernent has terminated and Bolides nil1 proceed ii-irh its 
previously announced plans to close the !:,!fie. 

Under the acquisition agreement KGSlT n.as required to secure 
financing commitments sufficient to enable i t  to buy one-half of 
Gibraltar's net working capital (about $4,000,000) and to operate 
the mine for at least the next four years. In Boliden's opinion this 
wouId have required financing of about S20.000,000. A t  h'Gh4Tr 
request, Boliden had extended the date to satisfy the finsncin_c 
condition to 15Dec98. 

hiir. BuIow stared, "I very much regret the terrni?.-.*ir:n of c u r  
agreement with NGMT. Eoliden and KGMI' v:xked lorig u d  hard to 
put together a deal that would see the continued operation of the minc 
under the new management group and on a viable basis. The BC 
goueinment, Gibraltar enpIoyees and their union and the mine's 
principal suppliers and customers all gave their active support and 
are to be commended. Unfortunately, due t~ continued !ow copper 
prices, NGMT was not in the end able to raise the f'icrtncing for 
continued operations and Boliden has no alternative but to proceed 
with closure." 

Preparations for closure are expected to stzrt in the coming weeks 
and be substantially completed by the end of Fcbruuy, 1999. Union 
and staff employees at the mine wcre offera! an enhanced scverancc 
package in June, 1395 after Boliden first airmunced the impending 
c l o s x c  of the mint. Assistance for ernpf:?) res incluics relocation 
and retraining subsidies as wcll as sever:::::: payments exceeding 
those rcquired by provincial statute an2 i!ic Gibra!:z; collecti\.c 
agreeme I: t. 

[BOL-TI 107,014,547 SHS. 
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